UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

	X
In re SONY BMG CD TECHNOLOGIES	: Civil Action No. 1:05-cv-09575-NRB
LITIGATION	: <u>CLASS ACTION</u>
This Document Relates To:	 DECLARATION OF ROBERT S. GREEN FILED ON BEHALF OF GREEN WELLING
ALL ACTIONS.	 IN SUPPORT OF RICCIUTI GROUP'S MOTION FOR AWARD OF ATTORNEYS'
	FEES AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES

I, Robert S. Green, declare as follows:

- 1. I am a partner in the firm of Green Welling LLP. I am submitting this declaration in support of my firm's application for an award of attorneys' fees in connection with services rendered in the above-entitled action and the reimbursement of expenses incurred by my firm in the course of this litigation.
- 2. This firm is counsel of record for plaintiffs Tom Ricciuti, Yvonne Ricciuti, Mary Schumacher, Robert Hull, Joseph Halpin, Edwin Bonner and Erin Melcon.
- 3. The identification and background of my firm and its partners is attached hereto as Exhibit A.
- 4. A detailed description of contemporaneous time records, including the date, hours expended and the nature of work done through March 10, 2006 is attached hereto as Exhibit B.
- 5. The total number of hours spent on this litigation by my firm through March 6, 2006 is 568.07, for which the total lodestar amount for attorney/paralegal time based on the firm's historical rates is \$213,311.83. The hourly rates shown below are the usual and customary rates

Selection Criteria

Timekeeper (hand s Exclude: COST Case (hand select)

Include: SONY

Slip.Date

Earliest - 3/30/2006

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54797 TIME	RSG	2.40	495.00	1188.00	1188.00
10/31/2005 . WIP	+research SONY	0.00	Т		
Research and investigation and case development issues for Sony BMG case		0.00			
51496 TIME	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
10/31/2005 WIP	+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1	300.00	300.00
Research Sony DRM issues, XCP technology		0.00			
51497 TIME	GRB	0.00	450.00	000.00	
11/1/2005 WIP	+discovery SONY	2.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00	300.00
Research XCP and Sunncomm issues, installed XCP rootkit onto firm laptop for testing		0.00			
51498 TIME	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
11/2/2005 WIP	+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1	300.00	300.00
Research Sony DRM, post information on website		0.00			
54826 TIME	RSG	1.50	495.00	742.50	742.50
11/2/2005 WIP	+research SONY	0.00	493.00 T	742.30	742.50
Begin review of internet based sources for research on potential claims against Sony BMG		0.00			
51499 TIME	GRB	1.00	150.00	150.00	150.00
11/3/2005 WIP	+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1	130.00	130.00
Further research on XCP and Sony DRM		0.00			

ge	2

01: 15						
Slip ID		Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info		Adjustment
Description	•	Case	Variance	Bill Status		Markup
54827	TIME	RSG	5.10	495.00	2524.50	0504.50
11/3/2005		+research	0.00	495.00 T	2024.00	2524.50
WIP		SONY		•		
Further fact res	search into blogs and related	•	0.00			
debacle: review	es regarding Sony BMG DRM v press and other public	1				
information on	claims; begin research into					
	authority for claims					
54828	TIME	200				
11/4/2005	TIIVIE	RSG +research	6.50	495.00	3217.50	3217.50
WIP		SONY	0.00	Т		
	ive research regarding		0.00			
developing clai	ms					
51500	TIME	GRB	2.00	+#O 00	000.00	
11/4/2005		+discovery	2.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00	300.00
WIP		SONY	0.00	191		
	ove Sony DRM from form		0.00			
aptop, luttner i	research on Sony DRM					
50719	TIME	APS	3.10	225.00	697.50	697.50
11/4/2005		+research	0.00	T@1	007.00	057.50
WIP	sh and O sure DDS 4 /	SONY				
mieniet iesear	ch on Sony DRM issue		0.00			
50718	TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/4/2005		+research	0.00	T@1	45.00	43.00
WIP Mosting with B	Cross reviewed to the contract to	SONY				
case	Green re: investigation into		0.00			
50720	ПМЕ	APS	6.00	225.00	1350.00	1350.00
11/5/2005 WIP		+research	0.00	T@1		
	dum to R. Green re: draft	SONY	0.00			
	otential complaint		0.00			
54829	ПМЕ	RSG				
11/5/2005		+research	5.00	495.00	2475.00	2475.00
WIP		SONY	0.00	Т		
Continue resear	rch into relevant statutes;		0.00			
review DMCA; (CFAA and other statutes and					
BMG	and complaints against Sony					
W771 W						

Slip ID		Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time Posting Status	•	Activity Case	DNB Time	Rate Info	Onp value	Adjustment Markup
Description			Variance	Dir Otatao		warkup
50730	TIME	APS	1.60	225.00	360.00	360.00
11/7/2005		+pldgs/motions	0,00	T@1		000.00
WIP		SONY				
Draft Complaint			0.00			
50733	TIME	ADO				
11/7/2005	IIVIE	APS	1.40	225.00	315.00	315.00
WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
	et for news articles to gathe	er	0.00			
for factual allega	ation section					
50727	ПМЕ	APS				
11/7/2005	1 11 V 1 L		0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Email to M.Gun	n re: potential client claim		0.00			
50726	TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45,00
11/7/2005		+pldgs/motions	0.00	T@1	45.00	43.00
WIP		SONY	0.00	161		
Email to M.Dion	re: potential client claim		0.00			
50725	ПМЕ	ADO				
11/7/2005	I II VI L	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
	e call to C.Lauretano re:	30111	0.00			
investigation	o o o cado da lo lo.		0.00			
J						
50724	TIME	APS	0.10	225.00	22.50	22.50
11/7/2005		+pldgs/motions	0.00	T@1	££.00	<i>aa.</i> 00
WIP		SONY	0.00			
Email to J.Frenc	h re: investigation		0.00			
50723	ПМЕ	APS	0.40			
11/7/2005	11101		0.40	225.00	90.00	90.00
WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
	e: class investigation	JONT	0.00			
	3		0.00			
54830	TIME	RSG	4.20	495.00	2079.00	2079.00
11/7/2005		+research	0.00	Т	20,0.50	2070.00
WIP		SONY				
Further work and	development of research		0.00	•		
into issues unde	r DMCA; CFAA and state					
	inicate with colleagues and					
	me; begin work on					
complaint assert	ing ciaims					

City In						
Slip ID		Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time Posting Status	3	Activity Case	DNB Time	Rate Info		Adjustment
Description 1		Case	Variance	Bill Status		Markup
51501	TIME	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
11/7/2005		+discovery	0.00	T@1	500.00	300.00
WIP		SONY				
Reformat firm la	aptop, run tests on Suncomi	m	0.00			
disc, luttner res	search on Sony DRM			•		
51967	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/8/2005		+meetings/commu	0.00	T@1	07.50	67.50
WIP		SONY	7,00			
Update SUGAF	Profiles for Sony contacts		0.00			
51973	ПМЕ	APS	0.40	005.00	00.00	
11/8/2005	* 14 V F Sacra	+research	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
WIP		SONY	0.00	1691		
	et and read opinions in Direc	ot .	0.00			
Revenue case						
54831	TIME	RSG	5.00	495.00	0475.00	0.475.00
11/8/2005		+pldgs/motions	0.00	495.00 T	2475.00	2475.00
WIP		SONY	0.00	,		
	complaint and research in		0.00			
	is both factual and internet					
same	nicate with co-counsel re					
Samo						
51972	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/8/2005		+research	0.00	T@1	000	٧٢.٥٥
WIP	and the second s	SONY				
Revenue case	et and read opinions in Direc	:t	0.00			
. 10101100 0000						
51971	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/8/2005		+research	0.00	T@1	31.33	07.00
WIP		SONY				
Email to 1.Naye	es re:potential claim		0.00			
51970	TIME	APS	0.40	225.00	90.00	90.00
11/8/2005		+research	0.00	T@1	30.00	90.00
WIP		SONY				
Review of article	s on-line for DRM information	n	0.00			
50734	ПМЕ	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/8/2005		+pldgs/motions	0.00	T@1	73.00	45.00
WIP		SONY	-			
	Green to discuss fact		0.00			
investigation						

Slip ID		Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time	€	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	onp raido	Adjustment
Posting Status Description		Case	Manifester	Bill Status		Markup
50736	TIME	APS	_ Variance			
11/8/2005 WIP	THE	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Email to J.Doel agreement	nmer re: investigation/retaine		0.00			
50737	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	07.50
11/8/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	67.50	67.50
Email to M. Fis	cher re: investigation	00.11	0.00			
50743	TIME	APS	1.00	225.00	225.00	225.00
11/8/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
	with EFF to discuss and causes of action		0.00			
50744	TIME	APS	0.50	225.00	112.50	112.50
11/8/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Internet researc allegations	h for new facts for factual		0.00			
50745	ПМЕ	APS	1,00	225.00	225.00	225.00
11/8/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	223.00	223.00
Meeting with W	. Brasseur to edit complaint		0.00			
51502	ПМЕ	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
11/9/2005 WIP		+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1	300.00	300.00
Further research	n on Sony DRM		0.00			
50764	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/9/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		07.50
Update SUGAR	profiles		0.00			
50763	TIME	APS	0.10	225.00	22.50	22.50
11/9/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
Review SUGAR Brasseur re: Plu	profile of Plustoka; email W stoka inquiry		0.00			
	4 : 7					

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	•	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50762 11/9/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Emair to F. Hog	gers re: investigation		0.00			
50761 11/9/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Meeting with M procedure for S	. Herman re: SUGAR ony contacts		0.00			
50760 11/9/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +research SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Spoke to R. Grepotential clients	een re: purchase date for		0.00			
50759 11/9/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Phone call with	D.Priola re: potential claim		0.00			
50765 11/9/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to C. Will	iams re: Investigation		0.00			
50766 11/9/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
Meeting with W	. Brasseur to edit complaint		0.00			
54832 11/9/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.20 0.00	495.00 T	3069.00	3069.00
research in supp with expert Mark communicate w re potential clair	complaint and related port of claims; communicated Russinovich re claims; ith F. von Lohmann of EFF ms; examine research into performance and the like	3	0.00			
50758 11/9/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
	of M.Russinovich	CONT	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	•	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50757 11/9/2005 WIP Call to C. Willia	TIME ms re: potential client claim	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
50755 11/9/2005 WIP	TIME on re: potential client claim	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
50754 11/9/2005 WIP Edit draft of cor	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	247.50	247.50
50771 11/9/2005 WIP Edit complaint	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	292.50	292.50
51292 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	300.00 T@1	60.00	60.00
Discuss case w	Ath H. Green.		0.00		,	
54833 11/10/2005 WIP Review further n	TIME eports of XCP root kit	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.00 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	2970.00	2970.00
problems; review with staff and Codevelopments a	v cnet reports; communicate Cohn of EFF re case nd status of complaint; g on assessing appropriate	Э	0.00			
50790 11/10/2005 WIP Edit complaint	ТІМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	2.70 0.00	225.00 T@1	607.50	607.50
Lon Complaint			0.00			
50783 11/10/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Update SUGAR	profiles for Sony contacts		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50789 11/10/2005 WIP Email C. Willian	TIME ns re: potential client claim	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
50791 11/10/2005 WIP Email draft of Co	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
50792 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME of M.Russinovich in suppo	APS +pldgs/motions SONY ort	1.40 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	315.00	315.00
50787 11/10/2005 WIP Edit complaint	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.00 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
50786 11/10/2005 WIP Email to J.Gonz claim	TIME ales re: potential client	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
50785 11/10/2005 WIP Email to N.Mora	TIME les re: potential client clain	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
50784 11/10/2005 WIP Email J.Wohlma	TIME In re: potential claims	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
50788 11/10/2005 WIP Email D.Hamilto	TIME n re: potential claim	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
50781 11/10/2005 WIP Email to P.Rodg	TIME ers re: potential client clain	APS +pldgs/motions SONY n	0.30 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50780 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Spoke to D. Bur	nger re: potential case		0.00			
50778 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email W. Como	re: Investigation		0.00			
50777 11/10/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Review website	for partnership information		0.00			
50776 11/10/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to R. Gree complaint	en re: defendants for		0.00			
50774 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to W. Phil	ips re: potential client clain	1	0.00			
50773 11/10/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to P.Rodg	ers re: potential client clain	n	0.00			
54834 11/11/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	5.70 0.00	495.00 T	2821.50	2821.50
research and ass preliminary injun- communications status and with I expert re claims; status of A. Halo expert; communi- claims and retair	with C. McSherry of EFF r 3. Edelman, a potential communicate with EFF re lerman as a potential cate with plaintiff R. Hull re ner agreement; th staff regarding plaintiffs		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time	a	Timekeeper Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value	Billed SV
Posting Status Description		Case	Variance	Bill Status		Adjustment Markup
50582	TIME	JWW	0.20	350.00	70.00	70.00
11/11/2005 WIP		+research SONY	0.00	T@1	7 0.00	70.00
Read Chron art issue. Email s	icle re: Sony CD software ame to R. Green, A. Sharm	a.	0.00			
50806	ПМЕ	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/11/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	07.00	37.00
Prepare retaine email agreeme	r agreement for R.Hull and nt to R. Hull		0.00			
50872	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/11/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	67.50	07.50
Spoke with W. hard drive evide	Brasseur and R. Green re: nce		0.00			
50801	ПМЕ	APS	0.00	005.00	m.m.m.	
11/11/2005 WJP	1 HV1 hos	+pldgs/motions SONY	2.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	517.50	517.50
Edit declaration of preliminary in	i of M.Russinovich In suppor ijunction		0.00			
50802	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	C7 C0
11/11/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	07.50	67.50
Spoke to P.Rog plaintiff	gers about potential named		0.00			
50803	ПМЕ	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	07 50
11/11/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	725.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Review/consult	New York law practice book		0.00			
50804	TIME	APS	0.50	005.00		
11/11/2005 WIP	(IIVIL	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Westlaw resear	ch for New York law		0.00			
50805	ПМЕ	APS	0.00	005.00		
11/11/2005 WIP	1 11V(Lux	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Spoke to R.Hull	re: potential plaintiff		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50797 11/11/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to M. Bo	kash re: potential client cla	im	0.00			
50807 11/11/2005 WIP	TIME potential claims under New	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
York law	potential claims under New		0.00			
50871 11/11/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email R. Hull r	e: hard drive evidence		0.00			
50798 11/11/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to M. Va potential client	nderbilt re: follow-up - claim		0.00			
50796 11/11/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to M.Var claim	derbilt re: potential client		0.00			
50795 11/11/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Review contacts Sony	s and e-mails received about	t	0.00			
50794 11/11/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to M.Drey	yfus re: investigation		0.00			
50793 11/11/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +research SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Review article o Welling	n Sony lawsuit per J.		0.00			
51503 11/11/2005 WIP	TIME	GRB +discovery SONY	1.50 0.00	150.00 T@1	225.00	225.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Further research on Sony DRM, client drive backup machanism research	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54835 TIME 11/12/2005 WIP Telephone conference with B. Edelman re expert analysis and import of his testing or potential claim for prelliminary injunction; further research on preliminary injunction issues and related statutes that would support an injunction	RSG +research SONY	7.00 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	3465.00	3465.00
54836 TIME 11/13/2005 WIP Further telephone conference with B. Edelman and review his work product regarding computer communications; review internet information regarding the SunCommissues		4.00 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	1980.00	1980.00
54837 TIME 11/14/2005 WIP Continue working on technical revisions to complaint and considerations of preliminary injunction factors; draft demand letter to Sony BMG regarding XCP and SunnCommissues; review Sony communications with consumers and information on client R. Hufinalize and disseminate demand letter		4.70 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	2326.50	2326.50
51504 TIME 11/14/2005 WIP Further research on Sony DRM, uninstallation tools, interface with client for hard drive replacement and shipping	GRB +discovery SONY	2.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00	300.00
51305 TIME 11/14/2005 WIP Research choice of law clauses in a license agreement; discuss same with R. Green; draft memorandum re same.	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.40 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	1920.00	1920.00

- u					
Slip ID	Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time Posting Status	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info		Adjustment
Description	Case	Variance	Bill Status		Markup
50873 TIME	APS	2.00	225.00	450.00	450.00
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	430.00	430.00
Research General Counsel info for Defendants in order to serve CLRA		0.00			
50874 TIME	APS	2.70	225.00	607.50	607.50
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	007.00	007.00
Prepare demand letter		0.00			
50875 TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Phone call with EFF re: demand le	etter	0.00			
50877 TIME	APS	1.30	225.00	292.50	292.50
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Call with R. Green and EFF to disc status of draft complaint and dema		0.00			
50879 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Meeting with R. Green and W. Bra discuss demand letter	sseur to	0.00			
50880 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	45.00	45.00
Phone conversation with R.Hull re: letter		0.00			
50881 TIME	APS	0.00	225 22		
11/14/2005 WIP	+research SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Spoke to W. Brasseur re: Hull's ha		0.00			
50882 TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/14/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	J, .00	57.50
Prepare CLRA letter for mailing and		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	3	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50883 11/14/2005 WIP Review draft co	TIME mplaint	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
riowow dian co	rrprant		0.00			
50884 11/14/2005 WIP	TIME .	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Spoke to C.Mc	Sherry at EFF re: demand		0.00			
50897 11/15/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.70 0.00	225.00 T@1	157.50	157.50
Phone call with to R.Hull; Meeti	R. Green and W. Brasseur ng with RSG		0.00			
50892 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	2.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	585.00	585.00
Draft memorand points of compli	lum to R. Green re: talking aint for Press		0.00			
50893 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Phone call with process	T.McSherry at EFF re: TRC)	0.00			
50891 11/15/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Edit CA compla	int		0.00			
50898 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Edit memorande complaint	um re: talking points of		0.00			
50899 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Edit CA Complia	ant	JONT	0.00	*		

- 1	5
- 1	

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50900 11/15/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to J.Gonz	alez re: potential client		0.00			
50901 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Email to E.Melo agreement	on re: investigation/retainer		0.00			
50889 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Email C.Kirby at re: press release	San Francisco Chronicle		0.00			
50887 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Review SUGAR	profiles; email Z. Tomcich		0.00			
50886 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Review e-mails fi	rom J.Gonzalez		0.00			
50885 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Edit GW press re	elease re: potential case	•	0.00			
54838 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	5.50 0.00	495.00 T	2722.50	2722.50
Washington Pos debacle; further of press release on communications Stone magazine communications demand letter an	with B. Hiatt of Rolling regarding issues; further with B. Edelman re d begin assessing music pacted and issues related		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51325 11/15/2005 WIP	TIME e of law and choice of forum	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	300.00 T@1	60.00	60.00
	omia; draft memorandum re		0.00			
51323 11/15/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	ECG +pldgs/motions	0.10 0.00	300.00 T@1	30.00	30,00
Review emails b	between GW and co-counse fornia complaint	SONY I	0.00			
50888 11/15/2005	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
WIP	profile of J.Gonzalez; email	SONY	0.00	191		
50902	ПМЕ	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/15/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	07.00	07.30
Review Los Ang cases in Los Ar	eles dockets for related ngeles Superior		0.00			
52011 11/15/2005	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
	T. McSherry re TRO Angeles Superior	SONY	0.00			
50903	TIME	APS	0.70	225.00	157.50	157.50
11/15/2005 WIP Research Los A	ngeles Superior TRO	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
process	ingeles Superior ThO		0.00			
50904 - 11/15/2005 - WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
* *	re: TRO process	3011	0.00			
50905 11/15/2005 WIP		APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
	re: potential plaintiff		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51313 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP Research choice of law and forum issi	ECG +research SONY	5.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	1500.00	1500.00
draft memorandum re same.	ues,	0.00			
50913 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.70 0.00	225.00 T@1	157.50	157.50
Conference call with EFF re: draft con		0.00			
50914 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Meeting with R. Green and W. Brasse SunnComm Issues for draft complaint		0.00			
50916 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	270.00	270.00
Internet research on Sunncomm and mediamax		0.00			
50917 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Draft Sunncomm factual allegations fo complaint		0.00			
50919 TIME	APS	1.00	225.00	225.00	225.00
11/16/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Call with EFF, R. Green and J.Cunard Demand letter	re:	0.00			
50920 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Call with EFF, R. Green re: prior call v J.Cunard; Meeting with R. Green re: N York Complaint		0.00			
50921 TIME 11/16/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Call with C.McSherry re: New York Complaint	00.11	0.00			

Slip ID	Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	onp value	Adjustment
Posting Status Description	Case	Variance	Bill Status		Markup
50922 TIME	APS	4.70	225.00	1057.50	1057.50
11/16/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	1007.30	1037.30
Draft New York Complaint		0.00			
51505 TIME	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
11/16/2005 WIP	+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1		
Research uninstallation issues, walk client through hard drive replacement		0.00			
50912 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/16/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Review email from R.Hull re: case information	on	0.00			
50907 TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/16/2005 WIP	+research SONY	0.00	T@1		
Research related case info for Los Angeles cases		0.00			
50909 TIME	APS	0.10	225.00	22.50	22.50
11/16/2005 WIP	+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
Email E.Melcon re: client info.		0.00			
54839 TIME	RSG	6.80	495.00	3366.00	3366.00
11/16/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions · SONY	0.00	Т		
Review Sony announcement on XCP issues further communication with expert B. Edelman re SunnComm issues; begin review SunnComm eulas; further assessment of banner notification issues; prepare for and participate in telephone conference with J. Cunard re Sony's response to CLRA letter		0.00			
50935 TIME 11/17/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
WIP Spoke to C.McSherry re: Expert declaration	SONY as	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50939 11/17/2005 WIP Edit draft of comp	ΠME plaint	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.90 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	427.50	427.50
11/17/2005 WIP Review K. Naddat	TIME 's previous memorandum and choice of forum ases in same.	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
11/17/2005 WIP	TIME ration for R. Hull; Email Hull to R.Hull	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
11/17/2005 WIP	TIME nerry re: edits to complaint	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
50936 11/17/2005 WIP Spoke to R. Gree	n and W. Brasseur re:	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
50931 11/17/2005 WIP Edit New York co	ΠΜΕ mplaint	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	2.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	472.50	472.50
11/17/2005 WIP	ΠΜΕ vith EFF re: complaints and	APS +pldgs/motions SONY d	0.70 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	157.50	157.50
11/17/2005 WIP	ΠΜΕ n on causes of action in N	APS +pldgs/motions SONY /	1.80 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	405.00	405.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
11/17/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	2.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	630.00	630.00
Edit New York co	mpiaint		0.00			
11/17/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.30	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Spoke to 1.Вало	w re: potential client		0.00			
11/17/2005 WIP Work on second	TIME demand letter and further	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	7.50 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	3712.50	3712.50
colleagues and E list of affected CE Kathrein re servin and communicate communicate witl second demand I Edelman re sche	plaint; communicate with FF re same; review Sony's play; communicate with R. of as New York counsels with EFF re same; h J. Cunard re response to etter; communicate with B dule and issues related to to California law versus					
11/18/2005 WIP	TIME	GRB +discovery SONY	2.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00	300.00
	on Sony DRM, compiling c iling on Docushare	of	0.00			
51507	ПМЕ	GRB	2.00	150.00	300.00	300.00
11/18/2005 WIP		+discovery SONY	0.00	T@1	333.50	000.00
	ond client for hard drive hipping, further research or	n	0.00			
54841	ПМЕ	RSG	5.80	495.00	2871.00	2871,00
11/18/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	493.00 T	2071.00	2671,00
and EFF re comp review, analyze ar J. Cunard's respor review and analyz	cations with R. Kathrein laint and class definition; and discuss with co-counse nse to my 11/15 letter; e work product of B. report on SunnComm		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description MediaMax		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50940 11/18/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	292.50	292.50
Edit draft of com	plaint		0.00			
50942 11/18/2005 WIP	ТІМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
	eles Superior Civil Cover s, and addendum		0.00			
50943 11/18/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Research CA A	gents for Service of complai		0.00			
50945 11/18/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.30	225.00 T@1	292.50	292.50
Edit CA Compla	int		0.00			
50946 11/18/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Call to EFF re: fi new Sunncomm	iling of CA complaint and info		0.00			
50947 11/18/2005 WIP	ТІМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Meeting with R. info	Green re: new Sunncomm		0.00			
50948 11/18/2005 WIP Edit CA Compla SunnComm alle	TIME int to incorporate new	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	6.70 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	1507.50	1507.50
	_					
50941 11/18/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
Research new S possible factual	Unncomm material for allegations		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54842 11/19/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	4.40 0.00	495.00 T	2178.00	2178.00
with B. Edelman issues related to home without ac eula; various co revisions to com	complaints; communication in re Sony response; discuss to Sony software phoning dequate disclosure in the immunications with EFF re inplaint and adjustments flect Sony's position for		0.00			
54843 11/20/2005	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions	5.00 0.00	495.00 T	2475.00	2475.00
and revisions or CLRA issues ar more extensive claims and addi	changing edits on complaint n 17200 disgorgement and mong co-counsel; begin analysis of Mediamax ress concems about damage ew and assess edits of team complaint	e	0.00			
50954 11/21/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email to M.Land	caster re: potential claim		0.00			
50958 11/21/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to M.Spn	uil re: potential claim		0.00			
50957 11/21/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Spoke to R.Hull	re: status of CA complaint		0.00			
51345 11/21/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00	300.00 T@1	120.00	120.00
	ndum re choice of law lew complaint and edit me.		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
50956 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP		APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to M.Hyder re	e: potential claim		0.00			
50955 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP		APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to D.Smeden	re: potential claim		0.00			
50951 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ИE	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to M.Woods	re: potential claim		0.00			
50953 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	МЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to D.Hill re: po	otential claim		0.00			
50952 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to J.MacMast	ter re: potential claim		0.00			
54844 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ИE	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	3.50 0.00	495.00 T	1732.50	1732.50
with S. Kamber; cor	co-counsel regarding cal nsider issues regarding rd drives; communicate d staff re same	il	0.00			
50950 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ME	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Email to H.Allen re:	potential claim		0.00			
50949 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ΛE	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	6.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	1440.00	1440.00
Edit CA Complaint			0.00			
52012 TIM 11/21/2005 WIP	ΛE	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email A. Binckley re	e investigation		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51041 11/22/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email Retainer	Agreement to D.Bunger		0.00			
50965 11/22/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Spoke with Allis complaint	son at EFF re: filing of		0.00			
51036 11/22/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Email to J.Gonz	alez re: potential claim		0.00			
51044 11/22/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to D.Fere	Il re: information for article		0.00			
51037 11/22/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +research SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to C.McS client's harddrive	herry re: preservation of		0.00			
51038 11/22/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
	ger re: potential client claim		0.00			
54845 11/22/2005 WIP	ТІМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.00 0.00	495.00 T	2970.00	2970.00
with co-counsel information on A "perfect placeme Mediamax issue Sharma and co-web-based publicritical issues be software; comm	participate in conference cateric case development; review at Halderman's analysis of ent" on the SunCommes; communicate with A. counsel re same; review cation of comparison on etween XCP and Mediamax unicate with M. Russinovich cony case; review final difornia claims	v	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51040 TIME 11/22/2005 WIP Email to R. Green re: potential client issue	APS +research SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
and call w/ D.Bunger	15	0.00			
51039 TIME 11/22/2005 WIP	APS +research SONY	1.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	337.50	337.50
Research on Perfect Placement product from SunnComm		0.00			
51045 TIME 11/22/2005	APS	1.30	225.00	292.50	292.50
WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Call with EFF re: filing of New York Complaint		0.00			
51050 TIME 11/22/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Meeting with R. Green and J. Welling re refining allegations in New York complaint, theories of liability		0.00			
51052 TIME 11/22/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	2.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	450.00	450.00
WIP Edit New York draft of complaint	SONY		191		
51270 TIME	NAMA	0.00			
11/22/2005 WIP	JWW +meetings/commu SONY	1.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	350.00	350.00
Strategy call w/ R. Green, A. Sharma, EFI co-counsel re: prelim injunction motion, Ne York complaint, dealing w/competing case with disfavored legal theories	- ew	0.00			
51054 TIME	APS	0.90	225.00	202.50	202.50
11/23/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Edit New York complaint		0.00			
51056 TIME 11/23/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
WIP Internet research on CD sales for factual	SONY	0.00	T@1		
allegations		0.00			

Page 26	
Rillad SV	

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	3	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51058 11/23/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
Westlaw resear complaint	rch on New York law for		0.00			
51062 11/23/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Discussion with service of Sony	R. Green and LRC re:		0.00			
54846 11/23/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	3.90 0.00	495.00 T	1930.50	1930.50
Work on drafting reviewing and end assessment of CFAA authorities Guidance Softw	g New York complaint; diting draft; research related applicable New York law ar es; communicate with vare, Inc. regarding potential e to be used to analyze s	i d	0.00			
51084 11/23/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
case info	ingeles local fules of felate	u	0.00			
51087 11/23/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
	nh re: related case .os Angeles complaint		0.00			
51085 11/23/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
information	re: related New York case		0.00			
52013 11/28/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Edit Notice of Re	elated Cases	w w 1 1 1	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51106 T 11/28/2005 WIP	TME re: strategy and	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.90 0.00	225.00 T@1	427.50	427.50
general goals of th			0.00			
51098 T 11/28/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Spoke to class me potential claims a	ember "Jesse" re: nd class information		0.00			
	ПМЕ	APS	0.80	225.00	180.00	180.00
11/28/2005 WIP	-1	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Edit Notice of Rela	ated cases		0.00			
51103 T 11/28/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
	potential client claim		0.00			
51102 T 11/28/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
* * * * *	: Sony's position on issue		0.00			
	пме	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/28/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
Email V. D'Asuelle	o re: potential claim		0.00			
51100 T	ПМЕ	APS	0.10	225.00	22.50	22.50
11/28/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
	re: potential claim	SONT	0.00			
54847 T 11/28/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	3.30	495.00 T	1633.50	1633.50
issues particularly injunction and ope	ith EFF re current strategy with regard to preliminary en issues with Mediamax; section of potential tion		0.00			

City In					
Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
Description	****	Variance			
51508 TIME 11/28/2005 WIP	GRB +discovery SONY	2.50 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00	375.00
Further research on XCP uninstall issues, security vulnerabilities, and Sunncomm		0.00			
51121 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45,00	45.00
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	40.00	40.00
Email to R. Green re: conversation with J.Cheney's clerk		0.00			
51108 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	45.00	45.00
Edit notice of related cases		0.00			
51113 TIME	APS	0.10	225.00	22.50	22.50
11/29/2005 WIP	+research SONY	0.00	T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to W. Brasseur re: compilation of datand info on Sony		0.00			
54848 TIME	RSG	2.70	495.00	1336,50	1336.50
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	Т		
Further work on the New York complaint, the preliminary injunction assessment and strategy issues; assess import of newly discovered security risk with the Mediama software		0.00			
51120 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	45.00	45.00
Spoke to Clerk's office at Los Angeles Superior re: reassignment of case; Spoke		0.00			
J.Chaney's clerk re: reassignment of case					
51128 TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	07.30	67.50
Call with C.McSherry re: filing of preliminar injunction motion	у	0.00			
51125 TIME	APS	0.00	00= 00	,	
11/29/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
Email to Co-cou Angeles Superio	nsel re: details of Los or Complaint		0.00			New Options with the state of the spine and the
51124 11/29/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to C.McSi judges; filing of e	herry re: reassignment of ex parte		0.00			
52014 11/29/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Spoke to R. Hull	re case		0.00			
51123 11/29/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to R.Hull r	re: file-stamped complaint		0.00			
51122 11/29/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to C.Cohn	re: file-stamped complaint		0.00			
51392 11/30/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	3.10 0.00	300.00 T@1	930.00	930.00
	m R. Green re new case for d forum memorandum; e same.	•	0.00			
51135 11/30/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	7.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	1620.00	1620.00
Edit New York C edits	complaint per co-counsel		0.00			
54849 11/30/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.00 0.00	495.00 T	2970.00	2970.00
issues and partic negotiations and	on preliminary injunction cipate and assess letter to J. Cunard re furthe s in the Mediamax software		0.00			
51509 11/30/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	GRB +discovery SONY	1.50 0.00	150.00 T@1	225.00	225.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Further research on un-install issues,	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
removal by third party antivirus tools		0.00			
51778 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP Participate in conference call re structure counsel and ex parte re consolidation.	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY of	0.50 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	150.00	150.00
51776 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP Email correspondence with R. Green about consolidation ex parte; research ex parte motions in San Mateo and in California Courts; discuss agenda upcoming conference call with R. Green	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY ut	0.60 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
51773 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP Revise memorandum re choice of law.	ECG +pldgs/motions SONY	1.40 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	420.00	420.00
54850 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP Conference call with BMG re security breach; reviewed notes on call; consider Sony BMG's request to extend public notion security problems with Mediamax; communicate with co-counsel re response to Sony and consider banner ads, physical notices and recall and other related issues and impact on our pending potential preliminary injunction motions; extensive communications with all co-counsel and staff on related issues; communications reassessment of claims of the Ricciuti plaintiffs; review further draft of the preliminary injunction motion and the choic of law memorandum	d :	9.10 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	4504.50	4504.50
51650 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP Email M.Stanley re: potential claim	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51647 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
Edit New York complaint; review articles o internet for more factual allegations	n	0.00			
51651 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Conference call with co-counsel and Defense counsel re: Sunncomm issues		0.00			
51652 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Edit New York Complaint		0.00			
51653 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email R. Green re: Sony Complaint edits		0.00			
51656 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Phone call with C. McSherry re: TRO/preliminary injunction motion		0.00			
51657 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.50 0.00	225.00 T@1	337.50	337.50
Edit preliminary injunction motion		0.00			
51649 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to R. Green re: website's inquiry on GW case		0.00			
51645 TIME 12/1/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Calendar pleading schedule		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
12/2/2005 WIP	ME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	2.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	517.50	517.50
Edit New York con	nplaint		0.00			
12/2/2005 WIP	ME Scarlett and C. McShern	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
re: edits to New Yo	ork complaint					
12/2/2005 WIP	ME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Phone call with C. I New York complain	McSherry re: edits to nat		0.00			
51658 TII 12/2/2005 WIP	ME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Edit New York com	nplaint		0.00			
12/2/2005 WIP	ME	GRB +discovery SONY	2.00	150.00 T@1	300.00	300.00
	database of articles on research on XCP and		0.00			
54851 TII 12/2/2005 WIP	ME	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	7.50 0.00	495.00 T	3712.50	3712.50
communicate with a review and assess preliminary injunction regarding collection information and relacommunicate with a regarding Mediama under consideration	further drafts of proposed on motion; assess issues n of personally identifiable ated definitions;	3	0.00			
51664 TIM 12/2/2005 WIP		APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Prepare exhibits for injunction; Email S.	r TRO/preliminary	CONT	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	9	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51666 12/3/2005 WIP	TIME rch on 17200 claims that	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	3.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	855.00	855.00
	for preliminary injunction		0.00			
51665	ПМЕ	APS	0.60	225.00	135.00	135.00
12/3/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Prepare exhibit	s for TRO-PI		0.00			
51667	TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
12/3/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
Email P. Farrel	re: potential client		0.00			
51668	TIME	APS	0.50	225.00	112.50	112.50
12/3/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Prepare exhibits	s for TRO/PI		0.00			
54852	ПМЕ	RSG	3.20	495.00	1584.00	1584.00
12/3/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0,00	Т		
Edelman regard infected CDs th	ess work product of B. ling Sony SunnComm at install after reboot withou	ıt	0.00			
application of e	Jia					
54853	TME	RSG	1.00	495.00	495.00	495.00
12/4/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	Т		
	ion on conference call with Mediamax patch issues		0.00			
51677	ПМЕ	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
12/5/2005 WIP		+meetings/commu SONY	0.00	T@1		
Email C.Purnell re: potential claim			0.00			
51681	ПМЕ	APS	0.80	225.00	180.00	180,00
12/5/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	.50.00	150.00
	Green re: letter to J.Cunaro		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51683 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP Spoke to C.McSherry re; draft letter to	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
J.Cunard		3.00			
51684 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Spoke to R.Katherin re; draft letter to J.Cunard		0.00			
51675 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP Conference call with co-counsel re:	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	270.00	270.00
response to J.Cunard letter		0.00			
51685 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Edit declaration of R.Hull In support of PI; Email Hull declaration to R. Hull		0.00			
54854 TIME	RSG	9.00	495.00	4455.00	4455.00
12/5/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	Т	00.00	, 150,00
Communicate with J. Cunard re Sony BMG's proposals with regard to the Mediamax software; review correspondence with J. Cunard re Mediamax patch and NGS software testing and the use of banner ads and its recall program; further consideration and assessment of potential settlement issues to discuss with Sony BMG; review and assess press release with EFF and Sony BMG; review consolidation order in the SDNY case and communications between J. Jacobson and R. Rothman re same; work on response to J. Cunard's letter of December 5, 2005		0.00			
51669 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Draft Hull declaration for PI motion	SONY	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51670 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motion SONY		225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Review Los Angeles local n	ules re: PI-THO	0.00			
51671 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motion SONY		225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Edit exhibits for TRO		0.00			
51672 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP Meeting with K. Trinh re: TF	APS +pldgs/motion: SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
mooning marrie marrie. It	io iiing	0.00			
51673 TIME 12/5/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motion: SONY	0.60 s 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Conference call with co-cou Correspondence from Sony confidentiality agreement		0.00			
52494 TIME 12/6/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 s 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Email to R. Green re update to J. Cunard	es to draft letter	0.00			
51700 TIME 12/6/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.60 s 0.00	225.00 T@1	360.00	360.00
Edit Letter to J.Cunard; Fax to J.Cunard	and email letter	0.00			
54855 TIME 12/6/2005 WIP	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	5.50 s 0.00	495.00 T	2722.50	2722.50
Review declaration draft from Mediamax security issues a preliminary injunction; further communications on the New and assessment of potential issues	n B. Edelman re and potential er v York action	0.00			
51699 TIME 12/6/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.40 s 0.00	225.00 T@1	315.00	315.00
Conference call with EFF re		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description to J.Cunard		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51693 12/6/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
draft letter to J.C	t. Green re: comments and Cunard		0.00			
51691 12/6/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +meetings/commu SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email J. Purrell	re: potential claim		0.00			
51686 12/6/2005 WIP	TIME	APS +research SONY	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
Call with C.McS	herry re: client computers		0.00			
54856 12/7/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	7.50 0.00	495.00 T	3712.50	3712.50
and coordination defense counsel request that we discussions with communication discuss potential assessment of it inadequacy of the New York; further co-counsel and of the Mediamax flaws; communication in suffiction in suffiction in sufficient in light of	various settlement issues and scheduling in light of is Europe trip; assess delay filing PI until further a defense counsel; with counsel in Texas to il claim in Texas; assues related to the lead counsel structure in er communications with defense counsel re impact a CDs and related security eations with self appointed ounsel regarding ettlement negotiations and of preliminary injunction the moving target my on these issues		0.00			
51711 12/7/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Conference call settlement with f	with EFF re: possible jederal cases		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51708 TIME 12/7/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00
Check SDNY docket for New York complaint; email K.Staddelmann re: Ne York complaint	w	0.00			
51705 TIME	APS	0.40	225.00	90.00	90.00
12/7/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	53.00	00.00
Review emails from possible named pla	intiffs	0,00			
51713 TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
12/7/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	43.00	45.00
Spoke to E.Melcon re: Named plaintiff		0.00			
51712 TIME	APS	2.10	225.00	472.50	472.50
12/7/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	472.50	472.50
Draft N.D. California complaint		0.00			
51720 TIME	APS	3.30	225.00	742.50	742.50
12/8/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	142.50	742.50
Review New York complaints; prepare memorandum to R. Green re: New York Complaints	(0.00			
51718 TIME	APS	0.30	225.00	67.50	67.50
12/8/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	07.00	07.50
Research articles on release date of XC update for allegations in complaint	;P	0.00			
54857 TIME	RSG	8.00	495.00	3960.00	3960.00
12/8/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T		
Communications with EFF regarding revisions to preliminary injunction issue and potential experts A. Halderman and Scheiar; participation in extensive call v EFF and defense counsel re case developments and settlement procedure review local rules for Judge Buchwald; communication with counsel in Texas repotential claims there; communication vil. Rothkin regarding our New York filings	fB. vith es; e with	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description his potential filing of a comple Northern District of California communications with Sony of interviews and other Mediams further review of Edelman dec support of potential prelimina motion and communications York plaintiffs' counsel regard settlement documents	; review in structured ax issues; claration in ry injunction with other New	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
52495 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Edit draft of ND Cal complain causes of action	APS +pldgs/motions SONY t with all	0.60 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	135,00	135.00
51714 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Edit N.D. California complain	APS +pldgs/motions SONY t	1.80 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	405.00	405.00
51715 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Edit declaration of R.Hull	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
51716 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Revise ND California Complai CA causes of action	APS +pldgs/motions SONY int to include	0.50 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
51717 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Draft notice of entry of order	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
51719 TIME 12/8/2005 WIP Conference call with Co-coun	APS +pldgs/motions SONY sel re: MDL	1.00 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
51722 TIME 12/9/2005 WIP Research MDL statutes and to Judge Buchald	APS +pldgs/motions SONY cases for letter	1.80 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	405.00	405.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51723 TIME 12/9/2005 WIP Conference call with co-counsel re: letter to	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.80 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	180.00	180.00
Judge Buchwald		0,00			
51727 TIME 12/9/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Prepare retainer agreement for T.Rice and C.Shavol		0.00			
54858 TIME 12/9/2005 WIP	RSG +settlement SONY	6.80 0.00	495.00 T	3366.00	3366.00
Extensive communications with co-counsel regarding settlement issues; communications with New York plaintiffs' counsel regarding drafts of settlement documentation and their refusal to produce information to us about the pending negotiations and documentation; work on letter to Judge Buchwald regarding the structure of plaintiffs' counsel; draft letter to E. Pritzker and S. Kamber re settlement issues		0.00			
54859 TIME 12/10/2005 WIP Telephone conference with B. Edelman re preliminary injunction declaration; analyze settlement issues and related Mediamax issues	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	6.20 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	3069.00	3069.00
12/12/2005 WIP Work on draft of letter to Court regarding CMO No. 1 and appropriate protections for class members that were not addressed in the order; various communications among co-counsel and defense counsel regarding continuing settlement discussions; receive and respond to correspondence from E. Pritzker re confidentiality of settlement documents; begin review of draft stipulation of settlement and further communications	RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	8.30 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	4108.50	4108.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description with potential experinjunction	rts re preliminary	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
12/12/2005 WIP	ME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
51746 TIM 12/13/2005 WIP	omplaint to TX counsel ME h co-counsel re: calls counsel	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.00 0.90 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	202.50	202.50
51744 TIM 12/13/2005 WIP Email C.McSherry r	ME re: client's harddrive	APS +research SONY	0.10 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
12/13/2005 WIP Further revisions an Court regarding prot telephone conference structure of settlement pleadings from New declaration; continuent	ce with D. Girard re lent negotiations; review Mexico TRO and related le review and analysis of agreement and th defense counsel re	d	8.50 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	4207.50	4207.50
51751 TIM 12/13/2005 WIP Conference call with deficiencies in settle SunnComm		APS +settlement SONY	1.00 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
51769 TIM 12/14/2005 WIP Spoke to N.D. Califo filling of complaint; s of complaint		APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.40 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	90.00	90.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status	Timekeeper Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Info	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment
Description	Case	Variance	Bill Status		Markup
51622 TIME 12/14/2005 WIP	JWW +settlement SONY	3.40 0.00	350.00 T@1	1190.00	1190.00
Discuss Sony conference call w/ R. Green. Suggest strategy/settlement San Francisco meeting. Participate in call w/EFF and Sony re: same.		0.00			
51771 TIME 12/14/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions	0.60 0.00	225.00 T@1	135.00	135.00
Conference call with co-counsel re: letter to J.Buchwald	SONY	0.00			
52308 TIME 12/14/2005 WIP	KPB +research SONY	0.40 0.00	140.00 T@1	56.00	56.00
Media article research & retrieval re Sony lead story in the Nov. 29 U.S. Law Week w/GW firm mention		0.00			
51765 TIME 12/14/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
WIP Calendar pleading schedule for ND California case	SONY	0.00	161		
E4640 What					
51618 TIME 12/14/2005 WIP	JWW +settlement SONY	0.30 0.00	350.00 T@1	105.00	105.00
Discuss negotiations and limitations of current draft settlement and need for EFF to weigh in w/ R. Green.		0.00			
54862 TIME 12/14/2005 WIP	RSG +settlement SONY	7.30 0.00	495.00 T	3613.50	3613.50
Various communications with EFF and defense counsel re substantive procedural and scheduling issues re settlement discussions; review congressional security advisor regarding downloading Sony music CDs on house of representatives' computers and impact on this action; further detailed analysis of issues presented by settlement agreement and issues to be negotiated		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54863 TIME 12/15/2005 WIP Various communications among plaintiffs'	RSG +settlement SONY	5.10 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	2524.50	2524.50
counsel regarding Sony settlement discussions and prepare for meeting with Sony in New York; draft and disseminate a stipulation extending the time period for objecting to CMO No. 1		0.00			
54864 TIME	RSG	4.80	495.00	2376.00	2376.00
12/16/2005 WIP	+settlement SONY	0.00	Т		
Further review of draft settlement agreement and assessment of extensive items to address with Sony in New York meeting; review exhibits and draft stipulation re CMO objections; prepare for New York meeting and telephone conference with B. Edelman re security issues on MediaMax	t	0.00			
52095 TIME 12/16/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
WIP Email to S. Scarlett re: follow-up call by R.Katherin to other CA attorneys	SONY	0.00	161		
52090 TIME	APS	1.10	225.00	247.50	247.50
12/16/2005 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		
Conference call with C.Cohn, R. Green, and J. Friedman re: settlement meeting		0.00			
52087 TIME 12/16/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.10 0.00	225.00 T@1	22.50	22.50
WIP	SONY				
Call with R. Katherin and S.Scarlett re: response to conference call with CA attorneys		0.00			
12/16/2005	APS +pldgs/motions	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
WIP Email to list-serv on status of conference call with other CA attorneys	SONY	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Tim Posting Status Description	;	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
52084 12/16/2005 WIP	TIME If with attorneys from other	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
CA state case			0.00			
52081 12/16/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.30 0.00	225.00 T@1	67.50	67.50
Meeting with J conference cal attorneys	Welling and R. Green re: with other CA state cases		0.00			
54865 12/18/2005	ПМЕ	RSG	16.00	495.00	7920.00	7920.00
WIP		+settlement SONY	0.00	Т		
	ettlement negotiations in office and follow up re same	•	0.00			
52105	ПМЕ	APS	0.80	225.00	180.00	180.00
12/19/2005 WIP		+settlement SONY	0.00	T@1		.00.00
Conference cal settlement mee	l with co-counsel re: 12/18 eting		0.00			
54866	ПМЕ	RSG	11.00	495.00	5445,00	5445.00
12/19/2005 WIP		+settlement SONY	0.00	T		
settlement doc	om New York; review umentation; work on various		0.00			
issues regardin	g settlement such as notice					
52104 12/19/2005	TIME	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
WIP		+settlement SONY	0.00	T@1		
Meeting with R. meeting	Green re: 12/18 settlement		0.00			
52114	ПМЕ	APS	0.20	225.00	45.00	45.00
12/20/2005 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	70.00	43.00
Email to R.Roth time; Spoke to stipulation to ex	nman re: stipulation to extend L. Cuesta re: edits to new ttend time	d	0.00			
54867	ПМЕ	RSG	6.90	495.00	3415.50	3415.50
12/20/2005 WIP		+settlement SONY	0.00	T	O+10.00	U+10,00

including revisions agreement and in p the notice program maximum coverage members from all p communicate with further work on stip	particular with regard to ; work on assessing a and notice to class perspectives; co-counsel re same; pulation re objections to order; communicate with	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
12/21/2005 WIP	ME notice of settlement and	APS +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
12/21/2005 WIP Review and comme	ME ent on drafts of notice and ement; communicate with e		3.10 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	1534.50	1534.50
12/21/2005 WIP Review settlement	ce and use of banner ads	APS +settlement SONY	0.50 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	112.50	112.50
52122 TI 12/21/2005 WIP Email to R.Rothma extension	ME n re: stipulation for	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
12/22/2005 WIP Review current draf		JWW +settlement SONY	0.60 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	210.00	210.00
12/22/2005 WIP		RSG +settlement SONY	2.40 0.00	495.00 T	1188.00	1188.00
Further review of ne	w version of settlement		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description agreement; communicate with co-counse and provide comments thereon	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
52140 TIME 12/22/2005 WIP	APS +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Call to R.Hull re: settlement agreement 51941 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP	JWW +settlement SONY	0.00 0.20 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00	70.00
Call w/J. Friedman re: NM TRO.		0.00			
51943 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP	JWW +settlement SONY	0.80 0.00	350.00 T@1	280.00	280.00
Read draft of settlement agreement for R. Green.		0.00			
51938 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP Read redline of settlement argeement. Discuss III B. (1) w/EFF. Discuss press releases and other sections of XI w/EFF.	JWW +settlement SONY	2.47 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	863.33	863.33
Discuss inclusion of value of media max concessions w/ C. Cohen.					
51931 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP Conference call re: reverse engineering w. Cohen, E. Printzker, J. Cunard.	JWW +settlement SONY /C.	1.50 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	525.00	525.00
51940 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP	JWW +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00	70.00
Call w/J. Jacobson re: MDL petition.		0.00			
52152 TIME 12/23/2005 WIP	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.20	225.00 T@1	45.00	45.00
Email J. Jacobson re: stipulation to extentime	d	0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54870 12/23/2005 WIP Further work on	TIME revisions to draft settlemen	RSG +settlement SONY t	1.50 0.00 0.00	495.00 T	742.50	742.50
51932 12/24/2005 WIP Read revised se disparities betwe suggestions from	TIME ttlement agreement. Note een circulated draft and EFF n Friday.	JWW +settlement SONY	1.50 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	525.00	525.00
51933 12/24/2005 WIP Email correspon Cohen, J. Jacob settlement agree	TIME dence w/E. Pritzker, C. son re: final draft of ement.	JWW +settlement SONY	0.50 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	175.00	175.00
51934 12/25/2005 WIP Read email from settlement terms	TIME C. Cohen evaluating 3.	JWW +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00	70.00
signing or object	TIME W/EFF, co-counsel re: ing to settlement, obal terms and class	JWW +settlement SONY	1.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	350.00	350.00
51923 12/26/2005 WIP EMail and phone Jacobson re: fina agreement, NM 0	TIME correspondence w/J. al terms, exhibits to Case.	JWW +settlement SONY	0.40 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	140.00	140.00
order, final appro	ement, preliminary approval	JWW +settlement SONY	1.20 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	420.00	420.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
51925 12/27/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	JWW +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00	70.00
Phone call w/ C. notice.	. McSherry re: proposed		0.00			
51924 12/27/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	JWW +settlement SONY	1.50 0.00	350.00 T@1	525.00	525.00
Review proposed	d final order. Discuss edits ohen. Call and email E. obson re: same.		0.00			
54871 12/29/2005 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +settlement SONY	1.40 0.00	495.00 T	693.00	693.00
settlement and o	developments regarding communications with J. ensions of time to answer in on		0.00			
52652 1/2/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +settlement SONY	5.40 0.00	550.00 T@1	2970.00	2970.00
co-counsel and o transfers and ME	ations and emails with defense counsel re venue DL issues, review final ement and motion		0.00			
52884 1/2/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	7.90 0.00	250.00 T@1	1975.00	1975.00
Draft Amended N	Motion to Transfer to SDNY		0.00			
52890 1/3/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.50 0.00	250.00 T@1	375.00	375.00
Draft stipulation t	to transfer cases	33111	0.00			
52467 1/3/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	JWW +pldgs/motions SONY	0.10 0.00	395.00 T@1	39.50	39.50
Call w/J. Jacobso Email J. Friedma	on re: MDL filing for SDNY. in, S. Scarlette re: same.		0.00			
52478 1/3/2006 WIP		JWW +meetings/commu SONY	1.50 0.00	395.00 T@1	592.50	592.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
Conference call w/EFF, J. Friedman, R Rothman re: preliminary approval heari revised MDL papers, public announcem negotiations w/SONY.	ng,	0.00	-		
52655 TIME 1/3/2006 WIP	RSG +settlement SONY	6.30 0.00	550.00 T@1	3465.00	3465.00
Conference call with co-counsel re settlement issues; review and edit ame MDL petition; further review of settleme documentation; finalize and file stipulat transfer of Melcon action	inded nt	0.00			
52894 TIME	APS	0.90	250.00	005.00	005.00
1/3/2006 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	225.00	225.00
Edit stipulation to transfer		0.00			
52893 TIME	APS	0.10	250.00	25.00	25.00
1/3/2006 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1		20,00
Email to R. Green re: service to Defend of ND California complaint	ants	0.00			
52887 TIME	APS	0.30	250.00	75.00	75.00
1/3/2006 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	7@1	75.00	75.00
Review MDL rules on filing motion to tra	nsfer	0.00			
52888 TIME	APS	1.70	250.00	425.00	425.00
1/3/2006 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	120.00	423.00
Conference call with co-counsel re: 1/6 hearing		0.00			
52901 TIME	APS	0.10	250.00	05.00	07.00
1/4/2006 WIP	+settlement SONY	0.00	250.00 T@1	25.00	25.00
Email R.Hull re: settlement information f client	or	0.00			
52442 TIME	JWW	0.10	30E 00	20.50	00.50
1/5/2006 WIP	+settlement SONY	0.00	395.00 T@1	39.50	39.50
Respond to C. McSherry re: exhibits to notice.	00.77	0.00		,	

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
52664 TIN 1/5/2006 WIP		RSG +pldgs/motions SONY	1.50 0.00	550.00 T@1	825.00	825.00
Work on transfer sti	pulations		0.00			
53099 TIM 1/6/2006 WIP Call with C. McSher	ME Ty to gather information	APS +research SONY	0.20 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	50.00	50.00
on SunnComm Perfe	ect Placement product		0.00			
52931 TIM 1/6/2006 WIP Call with C. McSher		APS +research SONY	0.20 0.00	250.00 T@1	50.00	50.00
perfect placement in	formation		0.00			
52430 TIM 1/9/2006 WIP		JWW +settlement SONY	0.30 0.00	395.00 T@1	118.50	118.50
Read email corresponder: AG contacts and preliminary approval			0.00			
52802 TIM 1/26/2006 WIP	1E	RSG +settlement SONY	1.20 0.00	550.00 T@1	660.00	660.00
Conference with J. F meeting with Sony	riedman re settlement		0.00			
	1 pare					
1/30/2006 WIP		RSG +settlement SONY	1.50 0.00	550.00 T@1	825.00	825.00
Conference with co-coon settlement; resea authorities	counsel re open issues irch re 2nd Circuit		0.00			
53271 TIM 1/30/2006 WIP	E	KDN +research SONY	2.50 0.00	275.00 T@1	687.50	687.50
Researched on West notice requirements to 2nd Circuit and SDN	for attorney fees in the		0.00			
52818 ΠΜ 1/31/2006 WIP		RSG +settlement SONY	2.30 0.00	550.00 T@1	1265.00	1265.00
Further review of plea	idings submitted by		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Time	Timekeeper Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment
Posting Status	Case	2,1110	Bill Status		Markup
Description Sony on settlement; assess form of notice and related issues	3	<u>Variance</u>	-		- MATERIA CONTRACTOR C
53282 TIME 1/31/2006 WIP	KDN +research SONY	6.75 0.00	275.00 T@1	1856.25	1856.25
Research settlement notice requirements attorney fees in the 2nd Circuit and SDNY (re lodestar and acceptable multipliers) Talked to R. Green about my findings throughout the day.	for	0.00			
53287 TIME 1/31/2006 WIP	KDN +research SONY	0.25 0.00	275.00 T@1	68.75	68.75
Sent R. Green and email summarizing the pertninent cases in the 2nd circuit and SDNY about settlement notices containing attorney fees.		0.00			
52946 TIME 2/1/2006 WIP	RSG +settlement SONY	3.80 0.00	550.00 T@1	2090.00	2090.00
Review form of notice to class as revised; conference with co-counsel re same; work on letter to court re revisions to settlement		0.00			
53523 TIME	KDN	3.50	275.00	962.50	962.50
2/1/2006 WIP	+research SONY	0.00	T@1	00	302.50
Researched Second Circuit and SDNY cas law on Westlaw re attorney fee requiremer in the settlement notice	se	0.00			
53644 TIME	JWW	0.20	395.00	79.00	79.00
2/2/2006 WIP	+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	70.00	73.00
Read letter to Judge re modification of settlement agreement; email comments to J. Friedman re same		0.00			
52952 TIME	RSG	3.90	550.00	2145.00	2145.00
2/2/2006 WIP	+settlement SONY	0.00	T@1	£170.00	2140.00
Conference calls with co-counsel and Sony counsel re revisions to settlement and notice; conference with D. Girard re same	,	0.00			

51

Slip ID Dates and Time		Timekeeper	Units	Rate	Slip Value	Billed SV
Posting Status Description		Activity Case	DNB Time Variance	Rate Info Bill Status		Adjustment Markup
53529 TIME 2/2/2006 WIP		KDN +research SONY	1.50 0.00	275.00 T@1	412.50	412.50
Further research attomey for settlement notices on	fee requirements Westlaw		0.00			
53541 TIME 2/3/2006 WIP		KDN +pldgs/motions SONY	2.50 0.00	275.00 T@1	687.50	687.50
Worked on pro hac vice a Welling and R. Green. Lo rules online. Talked to L. Sharma about the rules at Helped A. Sharma draft at paralegal about the proper Compared various forms upon the proper compared various forms.	ooked up SDNY Cuesta and A. nd proper format. n email to Lerach's r PHV procedures.		0.00			
53633 TIME 2/3/2006 WIP		JWW +court SONY	0.30 0.00	395.00 T@1	118.50	118.50
Suggest edits to response modification of agreement	e letter to court re	00111	0.00			
53678 TIME 2/3/2006		APS +pldgs/motions	0.50 0.00	250.00 T@1	125.00	125.00
WIP Conference call with Elect Foundation and co-counse from D. Girard to J. Buchw	ronic Frontier of re 2/2/06 letter	SONY	0.00			
52959 TIME		RSG	3.90	550.00	2145.00	2145.00
2/3/2006 WIP	;	+settlement SONY	0.00	T@1	21 10.00	2140.00
Work on response to D. G court re settlement revision conferences and emails ar and defense counsel re sa	ns; multiple mong co-counsel		0.00			
53683 TIME	,	APS	0.30	250.00	75.00	75.00
2/3/2006 WIP	9	+research SONY	0.00	T@1	75.00	73.00
Pro hac vice research re S Court in New York	outhern District		0.00			
53687 TIME	A	APS	0.20	250.00	50.00	50.00
2/6/2006 WIP	5	settlement SONY	0.00	T@1		30.00
Call with R. Hull re terms of	f amended		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Tim Posting Status Description settlement		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
53688 2/6/2006 WIP	TIME een re conversation with R.	APS +settlement SONY	0.30 0.00	250.00 T@1	75.00	75,00
Hull	een ie conversation with M.		0.00			
53701 2/7/2006 WIP	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	1.70 0.00	250.00 T@1	425.00	425.00
Edit amended	complaint per R. Green edi	ts	0.00			
53776 2/7/2006 WIP	TIME	RSG +settlement SONY	2.10 0.00	550.00 T@1	1155.00	1155.00
Work on notice	e issues re settlement		0.00			
53703 2/7/2006 WIP	TIME	APS +research SONY	0.90 0.00	250.00 T@1	225.00	225.00
Research priva	cy statutes per R. Green		0.00			
53698 2/7/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	APS +settlement SONY	0.20 0.00	250.00 T@1	50.00	50.00
Email R. Hull r	e final approval		0.00			
53713 2/8/2006 WIP	TIME	APS +settlement SONY	1.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	250.00	250.00
Review hearing	order per R. Green		0.00			
53598 2/10/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	JWW +settlement SONY	0.10 0.00	395.00 T@1	39.50	39.50
Email correspo agreement and	ndence with Eff re delegation availability for conference c	n all	0.00			
53801 2/14/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	RSG +settlement SONY	1.00 0.00	550.00 T@1	550.00	550.00
Conference call follow up re sar	l re delegation issue and ne		0.00			

Slip ID Dates and Tim Posting Status Description	3	Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
53756 2/15/2006 WIP Calendar plead	TIME	APS +pldgs/motions SONY	0.50 0.00	250.00 T@1	125.00	125.00
Julian proce	ang soriodale		0.00			
53840 2/22/2006 WIP	ПМЕ	JWW +settlement SONY	1.00 0.00	395.00 T@1	395.00	395.00
improving notic	ll with EFF and co-counsel r e to Media Max class out banner CD's	€	0.00			
53835	TIME	JWW	0.20	205.00	70.00	
2/23/2006 WIP		+settlement SONY	0.20	395.00 T@1	79.00	79.00
Review and col re improving no members	mment on EFF letter to Sony vice to Media Max class		0.00			
53902	ПМЕ	KDN	0.00	075.00	***	
2/24/2006 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	2.00 0.00	275.00 T@1	550.00	550.00
Reviewed pro h up rules and pr L. Cuesta to fir	ac vice applications, looked for templates. Worked with alize copies.		0.00			
54066	TIME	APS	0.10	250.00	25.00	05.00
2/24/2006 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	25.00	25.00
Meeting with K applications for	Naddaf re pro hac vice R. Green and J. Welling		0.00			
54075	ПМЕ	APS	0.10	250.00	25.00	25.00
2/27/2006 WIP		+pldgs/motions SONY	0.00	T@1	23.00	25.00
application for F	ddelman re pro hac vice R. Green and J. Welling		0.00			
54078	ПМЕ	APS	0.40	250.00	100.00	400.00
2/27/2006 WIP		+settlement	0.00	Z30.00 T@1	100.00	100.00
	Mekon re settlement of Nev	SONY /	0.00			
54077	TIME	APS	0 mc			
2/27/2006 WIP		+settlement SONY	0.50 0.00	250.00 T@1	125.00	125.00
Email to E. Mal	on re settlement of New		0.00			

Green Welling LLP Slip Listing

Page 54

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description York cases		Timekeeper Activity Case	Units DNB Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value	Billed SV Adjustment Markup
54551 3/9/2006 WIP Call with J. Jaco	TIME	JWW +settlement SONY	0.30 0.00 0.00	395.00 T@1	118.50	118.50
54526 3/10/2006 WIP Call with J. Fried further negotiation	TIME dman re briefing fees and ons with J. Jacobson	JWW +settlement SONY	0.30 0.00 0.00	395.00 T@1	118.50	118.50
Grand Total		Billable Unbillable Total	566.57 0.00 566.57	_	212923.33 0.00 212923.33	212923.33

EXHIBIT A

FIRM RESUME

Litigation Approach

The Firm's business strategy is to aggressively develop and pursue opportunities in the field of class action litigation. The Firm's principals have many years of experience in class action litigation. The Firm relies heavily on highspeed scanning and paperless distribution through their computer system to generate efficiencies in legal research and drafting, time-keeping, financial control and planning.

The Firm's class action practice involves claims relating to violations of antitrust law, consumer protection laws, truth in lending legislation, financial services, securities offerings, accounting malpractice, breach of fiduciary duties of corporate officers and directors, and products liability.

The aggressive, result-oriented approach to client representation applied by the Firm and its principals has been demonstrated in the following litigation:

- McKesson Inc. Derivative Litigation. McKesson-HBOC, Inc. lost \$9 billion in stock market capitalization in one day during April 1999 after announcing that prior financial statements would be restated due to accounting errors. Rather than pursuing the individuals and companies who participated in the conduct that led to the accounting restatements, the company sued its own shareholders in a case that was promptly dismissed by the Ninth Circuit U.S. Court of Appeals. As co-counsel for plaintiff shareholders seeking to recover money on behalf of the corporation from the wrongdoers, the firm obtained an important decision from the Delaware Supreme Court expanding the rights of shareholders to obtain and inspect corporate documents where there is a proper purpose for investigating potential wrongdoing. See Saito v. McKesson HBOC, Inc., 806 A.2d 113 (Del. Supr. 2002). A substantial settlement on behalf of the Company was approved by the Delaware Chancery Court on February 12, 2006.
- In re Salomon Analyst Litigation. Green Welling LLP serves as co-lead counsel for the class. Pending in the U.S. District Court for the Southern District of New York, this case asserts claims against the securities analyst, Jack Grubman, and his employers at Solomon Smith Barney for manipulating the price of XO stock in order to gain investment banking business.
- In Re: Providian Credit Card Cases. Robert S. Green was appointed co-lead counsel in this national class action brought on behalf of Providian credit card customers who were improperly charged late fees, higher interest rates on balance transfers, and fees for add-on products, including Credit Protection, PricePro, Drive Pro, HealthPro, and credit line

increases. The San Francisco Superior Court approved a settlement for \$105 million, which covered restitution to Providian customers, "in-kind" payments to customers, and the costs and expenses of the litigation.

- In re: Tenet Healthcare Cases II. Jenelle Welling serves on the Plaintiffs' Executive Committee in this consolidated action seeking redress for uninsured consumers who received treatment from one of Tenet Healthcare's 42 California hospitals. The complaint alleged Tenet charged exorbitant and unconscionable prices, for example, marking up prescription drugs 1,038% on average, to increase revenues and profits. A national settlement was approved in August 2005 that provides for restitution, injunctive relief and \$4 million of cy pres damages. The settlement has been hailed as a model for how the nation's uninsured population should be billed for hospital care.
- XO Communications, Inc. Securities Litigation. Green Welling LLP represented shareholders in class litigation pending in Delaware who suffered losses in connection with XO's slide into bankruptcy in 2002. In September 2002, the Supreme Court of New York approved a global settlement of the New York and Delaware class action cases that provided a cash fund of over \$8 million to shareholders.
- Mitchell v. American Fair Credit Association. In February 2003, attorneys for Green Welling LLP with co-counsel negotiated an \$8.6 million cash fund to be distributed to victims of AFCA's credit repair scheme. Through the settlement, consumers also obtained debt forgiveness for outstanding membership dues and credit repair.
- Prata v. Bank One. Green Welling LLP represented the plaintiff class in this case involving "Same as Cash" credit card financing claims. On December 12, 2002, the Superior Court in Los Angeles approved a \$3 million cash settlement for California consumers who participated in the "Same as Cash" financing plan. Litigation of this case resulted in a oft-cited opinion interpreting Bus. & Prof. Code § 17200, Prata v. Sup. Ct. (2001) 91 Cal. App. 4th 1128.
- Starkey v. Rusnak BMW. Jenelle Welling led this class action asserting that expensive BMW wheels on new cars were secretly replaced before sale with lower value after market wheels. The action was resolved quickly to the benefit of the class, and included an agreement by the dealer to refrain from selling after market wheels on new cars.
- Demando v. Morris (Capital One Bank). Robert Green served as lead trial and appellate counsel in this TILA class action. The Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals reversed the district court's grant of summary judgment to the defendant and found that Capital One's notice of change in terms higher than that promised constituted a violation of the Truth in Lending Act. Demando v. Morris, 206 F.3d 300 (9th Cir. 2000). Overcharges were refunded to all affected cardholders.
- Prata v. GE Capital. Green Welling LLP restored another \$2.5 million to Californians who were duped by the "Same as Cash" advertising slogan and program that GE bought from Bank One. GE also agreed to refrain from using the "Same as Cash" slogan to advertise financing plans that require minimum monthly payments.

- Kalhammer v. First USA Bank. Robert Green served as primary counsel in this consumer class action asserting violations of the Truth in Lending Act and breach of contract. In November 1997, a settlement providing \$6 million in cash and credits to First USA credit cardholders was approved by the U.S. District Court for the Northern District of California.
- Calvin v. Zaken. Green Welling LLP attorneys represented retired and disabled individuals who were drawn into the Zaken Company's work at home scheme. The case asserted claims under California's elder abuse statutes, the Consumer Legal Remedies Act and California's Unfair Competition Law. Green Welling obtained significant monetary relief for the plaintiffs and an enforceable agreement strictly regulating the advertising and business practices of the defendants.
- Equitec Roll-Up Litigation. In 1994, Robert Green was a key member of the trial team in this federal securities class action. Plaintiffs asserted claims in connection with the merger or "roll-up" of ten real estate limited partnerships. By the end of a six month trial, the defendants including Dean Witter, Smith Barney, Hallwood and others had settled for over \$30 million.
- Brauer v. Primetime 24 Joint Venture and DirecTV, Inc. In this national class action, the Plaintiff sought damages for a class of 900,000 subscribers to satellite TV, whose network programming (ABC, CBS, NBC, Fox) was cut off after DirecTV and PrimeTime were found to have violated the United States Copyright Act by retransmitting the programming to those subscribers. Under a settlement valued at \$44 million, the defendants provided a package of free, premium movie programming to the class. The settlement was approved April 2001.
- In Re: Prison Realty Securities Litigation. In this lawsuit, shareholders of CCA Prison Realty Trust and Corrections Corporation of America sought damages on behalf of investors against a real estate investment trust and its officers and directors, following defendants' alleged false statements made in the context of a merger between Corrections Corporation of America and CCA Prison Realty Trust and subsequent operation of the merged entity. On February 13, 2001, the Court granted final approval to a settlement for over \$104 million in cash and stock.
- Isco v. Kraemer (In re UDC Homes, Inc). Securities class action against officers and directors of real estate development company and its auditors. Robert Green assumed lead role in obtaining \$16.75 million in partial settlements. Mr. Green also participated as trial counsel in a five month trial against the company's outside auditors.

- In re Bridgestone/Firestone, Inc., ATX, ATX II and Wilderness AT Tires Products
 Liability Litigation. Robert Green served as chairman of the Law Committee of this
 nationwide MDL products liability action brought on behalf of owners of certain
 Firestone tires and Ford Explorers asserting claims under the Magnuson-Moss Warranty
 Act, 15 U.S.C. §§ 2301 et seq., state consumer protection statutes and common law. In
 March 2004, a Texas court approved a nationwide settlement with Firestone. Firestone
 agreed to spend \$15.4 million on consumer education for three years and to implement
 tire design changes to provide better high speed capacity. Firestone also will replace any
 recalled tires still on consumers' vehicles at no charge. In June 2005, the Superior Court
 of California certified a class of California residents that purchased Ford Explorers.
- In re CARB Compliant Gasoline Cases II, JCCP No. 4449. Jenelle Welling serves as coliaison counsel in this anti-trust action pending in California Superior Court. Plaintiffs allege that Union Oil Company misled the California Air Resources Board (CARB) into adopting standards for the composition of summertime reformulated gasoline that overlapped with Union Oil Company's then undisclosed and pending patents. Through this alleged deception and other alleged anti-competitive acts, California consumers in the downstream market allegedly overpaid for summertime CARB-complaint gasoline.
- In re Dynamic Random Access Memory (DRAM) Anti-trust Litigation, MDL No. 1486. Green Welling LLP was appointed to the executive committee in this anti-trust action alleging price fixing and other collusion in the market for DRAM chips. Plaintiffs seek restitution and damages on behalf of indirect purchasers of DRAM (e.g., owners of personal computers). The remedies Plaintiffs seek were specifically excluded from the fines totaling roughly \$700 million that 4 defendants have paid as a result of the government's investigations.

Partners

Robert S. Green has practiced extensively in the fields of complex and class action litigation since 1988. He graduated with honors from the University of the Pacific, McGeorge School of Law in 1984. Mr. Green received his Masters of Business Administration degree from California State University-Sacramento in 1989 and his undergraduate degree with distinction from Oregon State University in 1981. He is an active member of the National Association of Consumer Attorneys (NACA) and of the Association of Trial Lawyers of America (ATLA), and is an Editorial Advisor for the Consumer Financial Services Law Report. Mr. Green also is a member of the Partners' Council for the National Consumer Law Center and is a former Chairman of the Board of Marin AIDS Interfaith Network.

Jenelle Welling graduated from the University of California Hastings College of the Law in 2000, where she was honored with the American Jurisprudence Award in both Moot Court and Trial Advocacy. She also was a member of the Hastings Women's Law Journal. Prior to law school, Ms. Welling received a Masters Degree in Public Policy from the University of California at Berkeley. She graduated with Highest Honors from the University of California at San Diego with a Bachelor of Arts degree in Political Science. Ms. Welling is an active member of the Bar Association of San Francisco (BASF), and the Consumer Attorneys of California (CAOC). She has lectured on mediating consumer class actions and presented a seminar on the basics of consumer class action litigation for plaintiffs' lawyers.

Associates

Elizabeth C. Guarnieri received her B.A. in political science from Rider University and graduated magna cum laude. She received her J.D. from Rutgers University School of Law and made the Dean's List while attending law school. She is licensed to practice in California, New Jersey and Pennsylvania. Ms. Guarnieri's practice focuses on securities fraud, antitrust and consumer class action litigation. Ms. Guarnieri serves on the Advisory Board for the Meiklejohn Civil Liberties Institute. She is also a member of the American Bar Association and the San Francisco Bar Association. Prior to joining the firm, Ms. Guarnieri's practice focused on complex civil litigation.

Charles D. Marshall has practiced in the field of class action litigation since 1998. He graduated from Loyola University Chicago School of Law in 1998, and received an ABEd. from the University of Michigan in 1994. Mr. Marshall represents consumers victimized by a wide range of corporate, banking and credit schemes, consumers who fall prey to credit reporting errors and consumers of defective products. He is a member of the American Bar Association and is licensed to practice law in California and Illinois.

Kamon Naddaf graduated from UC Berkeley School of Law, Boalt Hall in 2003. She was a member of the Berkeley Women's Law Journal and the Asian Law Journal. Ms. Naddaf received two BAs from UC Berkeley where she graduated with distinction in general scholarship and majored in both Political Science and Rhetoric. After earning her BA, she worked for Americorps focusing on homeless policy reforms in the Bay Area.

Avin P. Sharma graduated from UC Hastings College of the Law in 2004. He was a member of the Hastings International and Comparative Law Review. Mr. Sharma was a judicial extern at the San Francisco Superior Court for the Honorable A. James Robertson II, the Honorable James J. McBride, and the Honorable Ronald E. Quidachay. He was also a judicial extern for the Honorable Saundra B. Armstrong of the U.S. District Court for the Northern District of California. Mr. Sharma received a B.A. in Business Economics and a B.A. in Political Science from the University of California at Santa Barbara.

Brian S. Umpierre graduated from Villanova University School of Law in 1998. He was an extern for the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency - Region III in Philadelphia, PA and a member of the Latin American Law Students Association. He is a graduate of the University of Scranton, where he was a member of Alpha Kappa Delta, the International Sociology Honor Society. Mr. Umpierre is licensed to practice in California.

charged for each individual in all of our cases shown as a weighted average of the rates and hours available in 2005 and 2006. A breakdown of the lodestar is as follows:

INCEPTION THROUGH MARCH 10, 2006

NAME		HOURS	RATE	LODESTAR
Robert S. Green	P	296.70	501.10	148,676.00
Jenelle Welling	P	21.87	359.62	7,864.83
Elizabeth C. Guarnieri	Α	18.20	300.00	5,460.00
Kamon D. Naddaf	Α	19.00	275.00	5,225.00
Avin P. Sharma	Α	183.40	227.67	41,755.00
Katie P. Brown	PL	.40	140.00	56.00
Guillaume Brasseur	PL	28.50	150.00	4,275.00
TOTAL:		568.07		213,311.83

- (P) Partner
- (A) Associate

(CA) Contract Attorney or (OC) Of Counsel

- (PL) Paralegal
- 6. My firm incurred a total of \$14,181.17 in unreimbursed expenses in connection with the prosecution of this litigation. They are broken down as follows:

EXPENSES

From Inception to March 10, 2006

DISBURSEMENT	QUANTITY	PRICE	TOTAL
Meals, Hotels & Transportation			\$1,300.63
Photocopies	669 pages	\$.30	\$200.70
Postage	3	\$8.76	\$26.28
Facsimile	212 pages	\$1.00	\$212.00
Messenger, Overnight Delivery	88	\$164.37	\$741.48
Filing, Witness, Process Service and Other Fees			\$2,461.51
Lexis, Westlaw, Online Library Research			\$162.36
Class Action Notices/Business Wire	2	137.50	\$275.00
Experts/Consultants/Investigators		•	\$8,801.21
TOTAL:			\$14,181.17

7. The following is additional information regarding expenses for which we are asking for reimbursement:

(a) Filing, Witness, Process Service and Other Fees: \$2,461.51

DATE	VENDOR	AMOUNT
11/22/05	One Legal	\$1,006.56
11/23/05	One Legal	\$14.95
12/2/05	One Legal	\$49.50
12/1/05	One Legal	\$49.50
12/8/05	U.S. District Court	\$250.00
12/14/05	One Legal	\$45.25
12/15/05	One Legal	\$60.00
12/8/05	Spincycle	\$70.00
12/8/05	Spincycle	\$55.00
12/13/05	Stokes & Levin	\$211.95
12/13/05	One Legal	\$14.95
11/23/05	Stokes & Levin	\$211.95
11/23/05	Stokes & Levin	\$209.85
12/13/05	Stokes & Levin	\$211.95

(b) Meals, Hotels and Transportation: \$1,300.63. Expenses for meals, hotels and transportation were incurred for the following purposes:

NAME	DATE	DESTINATION	PURPOSE	AMOUNT
Robert S. Green	12/17- 12/19/05	New York	Settlement Meeting	\$1,300.63

(c) Photocopying:

In-house (669 copies @ \$0.30 per copy): \$200.70

Outside Photocopying Expenses: \$0

(d) Lexis, Westlaw, Online Library Research: \$162.36. These vendors included: Disclosure, Inc., Dow Jones Interactive, Dow Jones & Co., Inc., Lexis Nexis, CDA Investment Technologies, Pacer Service Center, West Publishing Corporation, and Choice Point. These

databases were used to obtain access to Sony Corporation's SEC filings and to do media searches regarding Sony BMG. The charges for these vendors vary depending upon the type of services requested.

8. The expenses incurred pertaining to this case are reflected in the books and records of this firm. These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers and check records and are an accurate record of the expenses incurred.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of New York that the foregoing is true and correct. Executed this 6th day of April, 2006, at San Francisco, California.

Robert S. Green